Bankruptcy (Désastre) (Amendment) (Jersey) Order 2012 Article 1

=

Jersey

BANKRUPTCY (DESASTRE) (AMENDMENT)
(JERSEY) ORDER 2012

Made
Coming into force

THE MINISTER FOR ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT, in pursuance of
Article 49A of the Bankruptcy (Désastre) (Jersey) Law 1990, orders as
follows —

1 Bankruptcy (Désastre) (Jersey) Order 2006 amended
In Article 5 of the Bankruptcy (Désastre) (Jersey) Order 2006 —

(a) in paragraph (a) for the words “£3500” there are substituted the words
“£4,350”;

(b) in paragraph (a) for the words “£1000” there are substituted the words
“£1,250".

2 Citation and commencement

This Order may be cited as the Bankruptcy (Désastre) (Amendment) (Jersey)
Order 2012 and comes into force 7 days after it is made.

Minister for Economic Development

States & Page - 1
of Jersey



Endnotes Bankruptcy (Désastre) (Amendment) (Jersey) Order 2012

Page - 2 States &
of Jersey



